
You can expect a full recovery from 
mood and anxiety problems. Below are 
the latest breakthroughs: 

Medication and Devices 

Lurisidone for bipolar depression in 
children and teens.  

Asenapine for prevention of bipolar. 

Lamotrigine for weight loss. 

Oxcarbazepine and amantadine for 
disruptive mood dysregulation disorder 
in children. 

Natural  

Acupuncture for sleep quality. 

Affron Saffron extract for depression. 

Lavender-sandalwood aromatherapy 
for anxiety during medical procedures. 

Devices 

Relaxis vibration pad for restless legs. 



moodtreatmentcenter.com/minddiet.pdf
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Mood News on Instagram. Inspired by 
the finding that supportive text 
messages can reduce depression, we’ve 
launched an Instagram account with 
positive messages, antidepressant 
advice, and hopeful research updates. 
Search for the key word “moodnews” 
on Instagram or follow on Facebook: 
fb.com/moodtreatmentcenter 

Text us. You can now reach our 
receptionist through secure text at 
(336) 722-7266 M-F 8:30am-5:00pm.  

Appointment reminders by text. We 
have a new system to give appointment 
reminders by text. 
 

Kelly Caniglia, LPC-A, brings experience 
with therapies for mood, anxiety, and 
trauma including mindfulness, CBT, and 
EMDR. She also works with dissociation 
and works at the national level to 
advocate for people with dissociative 
identify disorder (Greensboro office). 

Laura Davis, PMH-NP, completed her 
graduate training as a psychiatric NP at 
UNC-Chapel Hill. She has over 10 years 
of experience working with psychiatric 
problems and a determined compassion 
for those who suffer from them 
(Winston office). 

Jennifer Smith, F-NP, works with 
medication, natural therapies, and 
lifestyle approaches to help people 
achieve full recovery. She has 
experience working with both mental 
and physical health problems. In her 
free time she enjoys outdoors, hiking, 
and family (Winston office). 

Becky Stevens, LPC-A, holds two 
masters, in psychology from Boston 
University and in counseling from UNC-
Charlotte. She has experience as a 
therapist at an integrative health center, 
in career counseling, and as a co-leader 
of a bipolar education group. Before 
becoming a therapist, Becky worked at 
our center and helped organize MTC 
into what it is today (Winston office).  

 


